
  
 

 
 
Ref: FOI/00441/CMICB 
07 July 2023 
  
 
 
 
 

 
 
Dear  
 

Re: Freedom of Information Act 2000 
       Primary Care Network / GP Practice Information 
 

Thank you for your information request indicated in bold below, which has now been 
considered under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 by NHS Cheshire & 
Merseyside Integrated Care Board (ICB). I am able to provide you with the following 
information and responses.  
 

Please note from 01 July 2022, Clinical Commissioning Groups (CCGs) were 
disestablished, and their statutory functions and responsibilities inherited by NHS 
Cheshire and Merseyside ICB. 
 
Your Request: 
 

1) A list of all PCNs in your ICB area 
 

2) A list of all GP Practices in each of your constituent PCN areas 
 

3) A contact email address for each PCN (e.g. clinical director or generic 
email address) 
 

Our Response: 
 

1 – 3) Please find listed below the information held in respect of the Primary 
Care Networks (PCN) operating in each Place (former CCG areas): 
 

Please be advised that the PCNs along with their associated GP Practices and 
Clinical Directors for Cheshire East Place and Cheshire West Place are publicly 
available on our website via the links below: 
 

Cheshire East 
https://www.cheshireandmerseyside.nhs.uk/your-place/cheshire-east/ 
 

Cheshire West 
https://www.cheshireandmerseyside.nhs.uk/your-place/cheshire-west/  
 

Halton 
Information detailing PCNs and associated GP Practices are publicly available 
on the former NHS Halton & Warrington CCG website via the following link: 
https://webarchive.nationalarchives.gov.uk/ukgwa/20220707105943/https://ww
w.haltonwarringtonccg.nhs.uk/halton-services-and-information/halton-primary-
care-networks 

https://www.cheshireandmerseyside.nhs.uk/your-place/cheshire-east/
https://www.cheshireandmerseyside.nhs.uk/your-place/cheshire-west/
https://webarchive.nationalarchives.gov.uk/ukgwa/20220707105943/https:/www.haltonwarringtonccg.nhs.uk/halton-services-and-information/halton-primary-care-networks
https://webarchive.nationalarchives.gov.uk/ukgwa/20220707105943/https:/www.haltonwarringtonccg.nhs.uk/halton-services-and-information/halton-primary-care-networks
https://webarchive.nationalarchives.gov.uk/ukgwa/20220707105943/https:/www.haltonwarringtonccg.nhs.uk/halton-services-and-information/halton-primary-care-networks
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Knowsley  
Please find enclosed ‘Knowsley PCNs’ which details the PCNs operating within 
the Knowsley area, along with their associated GP Practices and Clinical 
Directors. 
 
Liverpool  
Please find enclosed ‘Liverpool PCNs’ which details the PCNs operating within 
the former NHS Liverpool CCG area, along with their associated GP Practices 
 
South Sefton  
South Sefton PCN. Please find enclosed ‘South Sefton PCN’ which lists the 
associated GP Practices. 
 
Southport & Formby 
Southport and Formby PCN. Please find enclosed ‘Southport and Formby PCN’ 
which lists the associated GP Practices. 
 
St Helens  
Please find enclosed ‘St Helens PCNs’ which details the PCNs operating within 
the St Helens area, along with their associated GP Practices and Clinical 
Directors. 
 
Warrington 
Please find enclosed ‘Warrington PCNs’ which details the PCNs operating 
within the Warrington area, along with their associated GP Practices and 
Clinical Directors. 

 
Wirral  
Please find enclosed ‘Wirral PCNs’ which details the PCNs operating within the 
Wirral area, along with their associated GP Practices and Clinical Directors. 

 

3) Please be advised that PCN Clinical Directors are not employed directly by 
Cheshire & Merseyside ICB. Therefore, the direct email addresses of PCN 
Clinical Directors are considered by NHS Cheshire & Merseyside ICB to 
constitute ‘personal information’ under the Data Protection Act and, as a result, 
are exempt from disclosure under section 40 (2) of the Freedom of Information 
Act 2000.  

 
NHS Cheshire & Merseyside ICB does not hold information listing the generic 
email addresses available to the public for each PCN operating in NHS 
Cheshire & Merseyside ICB. You may wish to request this information from 
each PCN listed in response to Question 1. 

 
Your Request: 

 
4) For each GP practice, the name of the clinical computer system used 
(e.g. EMIS or SystmOne) 
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Our Response: 
 

4) Please find listed below the information held by each of the former CCG 
areas that now make up NHS Cheshire & Merseyside ICB in relation to the 
clinical computer system(s) used by the member GP Practices in each area: 
 
Cheshire 
All member GP Practices in Cheshire use EMIS. 
 
Halton 
All member GP Practices in Halton use EMIS. 
 
Knowsley  
All member GP Practices in Knowsley use EMIS. 
  
Liverpool  
All member GP Practices in Liverpool use EMIS. 
 
Sefton 
All member GP Practices in Sefton use EMIS. 
 
St Helens  
All member GP Practices in St Helens use EMIS. 
 
Warrington 
Please find enclosed ‘Warrington GP Clinical Systems’ which details the 
member GP Practices of the former CCG area of Warrington, along with the 
clinical systems currently used. 
 
Wirral  
All member GP Practices in Wirral use EMIS. 
 

Your Request: 

 
5) A contact email address for each GP practice 
 

Our Response: 
 

5) Please be advised that GP Practice staff (such as Practice Managers) are 
not employed directly by Cheshire & Merseyside ICB. Therefore, the direct 
email addresses of the GP Practice Staff held are considered by NHS Cheshire 
& Merseyside ICB to constitute ‘personal information’ under the Data Protection 
Act and, as a result, are exempt from disclosure under section 40 (2) of the 
Freedom of Information Act 2000.  
 
NHS Cheshire & Merseyside ICB does not hold information listing the generic 
email addresses available to the public for member GP Practice operating in 
NHS Cheshire & Merseyside ICB. You may wish to request this information 
from each member GP Practice listed in response to Question 2. 
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Should you require any further information or clarification regarding this response or 
do not feel that your request has been answered as you would expect, please contact 
us to discuss.  
 

We also wish to take this opportunity to inform you that, where you are not satisfied 
with the response to your request for information, a formal complaints and internal 
review process is available. 
 

This can be formally requested by emailing foi@cheshireandmerseyside.nhs.uk and 
must be done within a reasonable time period (3 calendar months) from the date this 
response was issued.  
 

Where you remain dissatisfied with our review under the Freedom of Information Act 
or the Environmental Information Regulations, you may apply directly to the 
Information Commissioners Office (ICO) for a review of your appeal decision.  
Generally, the ICO cannot make a decision unless you have exhausted our complaints 
procedure. The ICO can be contacted at;  
 

The Information Commissioner’s Office 
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane 
Wilmslow 
Cheshire 
SK9 5AF 
www.ico.gov.uk   
 
Should you need any further clarification or assistance, please do not hesitate to 
contact us quoting the above FOI reference. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

mailto:foi@cheshireandmerseyside.nhs.uk
http://www.ico.gov.uk/
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Knowsley PCNs 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

PCN Name Practice 
Clinical Director / PCN 

Manager 

Central and South Knowsley 

Cedar Cross Medical Centre 

Dr Victoria Hoyle 

Dinas Lane Medical Centre 

Hollies Medical Centre 

Longview Medical Centre 

Nutgrove Villa Surgery 

Parkhouse Medical Centre 

Prescot Medical Centre 

Stockbridge Village Health Centre Surgery 

Tarbock Medical Centre 

West Knowsley PCN 

Aston Healthcare 

Dr Faisal Maassarani 

Bluebell Lane Medical Practice 

Colby Medical Centre 

Cornerways Surgery 

Hillside House Surgery 

Pilch Lane Surgery 

Primrose Medical Centre 

Roby Medical Centre 

Rose Heath Surgery 

The Health Centre Surgery 

Kirkby PCN 

Dr Maassarani & Partners 

Hassan Argomandkhah 

Millbrook Medical Centre 

St Laurence's Medical Centre 

Dr K F Thong (Macmillan Surgery) 

Trentham Medical Centre 

Wingate Medical Centre 
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Liverpool PCNs 
 

PCN Name 
PCN 
Code 

Practice 
Code 

Practice Clinical Director 

Aintree U80186 

N82037 Westmoreland GP Centre 

Stuart Laurie 
N82053 Aintree Park Group Practice 

N82110 Long Lane Medical Centre 

N82648 Poulter Road Medical Centre 

 
 

PCN Name 
PCN 
Code 

Practice 
Code 

Practice Clinical Director 

Anfield & Everton U49727 

N82011 Priory Medical Centre 

Tobias Keyser 

N82052 Townsend Medical Centre 

N82081 Islington House Surgery 

N82095 Albion Surgery 

N82099 Mere Lane Group Practice 

N82669 Great Homer Street Medical Centre  
 
 

PCN Name 
PCN 
Code 

Practice 
Code 

Practice Clinical Director 

Central Liverpool U35980 

N82033 Dingle Park Practice 

Cait Taylor 
David Lewis 

N82054 Abercromby Health Centre 

N82070 The Elms Medical Centre 

N82076 Brownlow @ Princes Park 

N82082 St James Health Centre 

N82115 Vauxhall Health Centre 

N82117 Brownlow Group Practice 

N82617 Brownlow @ Marybone 

N82645 Brownlow @ Kensington 
 
 

PCN Name 
PCN 
Code 

Practice 
Code 

Practice Clinical Director 

Childwall & 
Wavertree 

U65582 

N82014 Lance Lane Medical Centre 

Ayokunle Adebanjo 

N82026 The Surgery - Penny Lane 

N82059 Greenbank Drive Surgery 

N82079 Greenbank Road Surgery 

N82092 The Valley Medical Centre 

N82107 Edge Hill @ Mossley Hill 

N82108 Rutherford Medical Centre 
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PCN Name 
PCN 
Code 

Practice 
Code 

Practice Clinical Director 

iGPC U02731 

N82003 Dovecot Health Centre 

Naomi Rankin 

N82024 West Derby Medical Centre 

N82041 Oak Vale Medical Centre 

N82058 Rock Court Surgery 

N82074 Old Swan Health Centre  

N82094 Belle Vale Health Centre 

N82104 Stoneycroft Medical Centre 

N82633 Knotty Ash Medical Centre 
 

PCN Name 
PCN 
Code 

Practice 
Code 

Practice Clinical Director 

Liverpool First U54911 

N82002 Yew Tree Centre 

Abbas Syed 

N82067 Benim Medical Centre 

N82086 Abingdon Family Health Care Centre 

N82091 GP Practice Riverside 

N82641 Sandringham Medical Centre 

N82646 The Riverside Centre For Health 

N82663 Hornspit Medical Centre 

N82664 Rocky Lane Medical Centre 

N82668 Walton Village Medical Centre 

N82671 Bigham Road Medical Centre 

N82678 Stopgate Lane Medical Centre 
 

PCN Name 
PCN 
Code 

Practice 
Code 

Practice Clinical Director 

SWAGGA U57480 

N82001 Margaret Thompson Medical Centre 

Coleen McCabe 
& Udit Gupta 

N82004 PC24 - Garston FHC 

N82009 Grassendale Medical Practice 

N82034 The Village Surgery 

N82035 The Surgery Mather Avenue 

N82036 PC24 - Netherley HC 

N82039 Storrsdale Medical Centre 

N82050 Gateacre Medical Centre 

N82062 Fulwood Green Medical Centre 

N82066 Woolton House Medical Centre 

N82073 The Ash Surgery 

N82084 The Surgery Gateacre Brow  

N82106 The Village Medical Centre 

N82109 Speke Health Centre (Thakur) 

N82116 Hunts Cross Health Centre 
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N82650 Speke Health Centre (Singh) 

 
 

PCN Name 
PCN 
Code 

Practice 
Code 

Practice Clinical Director 

The Picton Network U53230 

N82022 Edge Hill Health Centre 

Rob Mcguire 

N82046 Sefton Park Medical Centre 

N82065 Earle Road Medical Centre 

N82089 Picton Green Medical Centre 

N82090 Green Lane Medical Centre 

N82662 Dunstan Village Group Practice 

 

PCN Name 
PCN 
Code 

Practice 
Code 

Practice Clinical Director 

North Liverpool U64639 

N82018 Ellergreen Medical Centre 

Daniel Morris 

N82019 Langbank Medical Centre 

N82048 Walton Medical Centre 

N82049 Westminster Medical Centre 

N82077 Bousfield Health Centre n82077 

N82078 Bousfield Health Centre n82078 

N82083 Jubilee Medical Centre 

N82087 Gillmoss Medical Centre 

N82093 Derby Lane Medical Centre 

N82097 The Grey Road Surgery 

N82101 Kirkdale Medical Centre 

N82103 Anfield Group Practice 

N82113 Fairfield Medical Centre 

N82651 Stanley Medical Centre 

N82655 Moss Way Surgery 

N82670 Dr Jude - Park View MC 

N82676 Fir Tree Drive Medical Centre 
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South Sefton  PCN 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

South Sefton PCN – Clinical Director: Dr Gillespie 

Surgery Name 

15 SEFTON ROAD 

42 KINGSWAY                                                                                 

AINTREE ROAD MEDICAL CENTRE 

BLUNDELLSANDS SURGERY 

BOOTLE VILLAGE SURGERY 

BRIDGE ROAD MEDICAL CENTRE 

CONCEPT HOUSE SURGERY 

CROSBY VILLAGE SURGERY /  CROSSWAYS PRACTICE / THORNTON PRACTICE 

EASTVIEW SURGERY 

FORD MEDICAL PRACTICE 

GLOVERS LANE SURGERY 

HIGH PASTURES SURGERY 

KINGSWAY SURGERY 

LIVERPOOL RD MEDICAL PRACTICE 

MAGHULL FAMILY SURGERY 

MAGHULL PRACTICE 

MOORE STREET MEDICAL CENTRE 

NORTH PARK HEALTH CENTRE 

ORRELL PARK MEDICAL CENTRE 

PARK STREET SURGERY 

RAWSON ROAD MEDICAL CENTRE 

SEAFORTH VILLAGE PRACTICE / LITHERLAND PRACTICE / NETHERTON PRACTICE 

THE STRAND MEDICAL CENTRE 

WESTWAY MEDICAL CENTRE 
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Southport and Formby PCN 
 

Southport and Formby PCN – Clinical Director: Dr Caudwell 

Surgery Name 

Ainsdale Medical Centre  

Ainsdale Village Surgery 

Chapel Lane Surgery / The Hollies   

Christiana Hartley Medical Practice           

Churchtown Medical Centre  

Cumberland House Surgery  

The Village Surgery Formby  

Kew Surgery  

HIGHTOWN VILLAGE SURGERY 

Lincoln House Surgery  

Norwood Surgery  

St Marks Medical Centre  

The Corner Surgery  

The Family Surgery  

The Grange Surgery  

The Marshside Surgery  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
 
 
 

Page 11 of 14 

 
St Helens PCNs 
 

PCN Practice 

Central PCN 

Clinical Director - Dr Paul Rose 

ORMSKIRK HOUSE SURGERY 

PHOENIX MEDICAL CENTRE 

LINGHOLME HEALTH CENTRE WA10 2HT 

HALL STREET MEDICAL CENTRE 

PARKFIELD SURGERY 

CENTRAL SURGERY ST HELENS 

NEWHOLME SURGERY 

MARSHALLS CROSS MC 

North PCN 

Clinical Director - Dr David Laswon 

BILLINGE MEDICAL PRACTICE 

RAINFORD HEALTH CENTRE 

KENNETH MACRAE MED CENTRE 

BETHANY MEDICAL CENTRE 

SANDFIELD MEDICAL CENTRE 

GARSWOOD SURGERY 

Newton & Haydock 
PCN 

Clinical Director - Dr Martin Breach 

PATTERDALE LODGE MED CTRE 

VISTA ROAD 

HAYDOCK MEDICAL CENTRE 

 
NEWTON MEDICAL CENTRE 

DR RAHILS SURGERY 

NEWTON COMMUNITY HOSPITAL PRACTICE 

South PCN 

Clinical Director - Dr Chibuzo Orjiekwe 

RAINBOW MEDICAL CENTRE 

BERRYMEAD FAMILY MEDCTR 

FOUR ACRE HEALTH CENTRE 

ATLAS MEDICAL PRACTICE 

THE SPINNEY MEDICAL CTR 

THE BOWERY MEDICAL CENTRE 

LONGTON MEDICAL CENTRE 

ECCLESTON MEDICAL CENTRE 

MILL STREET MEDICAL CTR 

THE VILLAGE SURGERY PRESCOT 

THE CROSSROADS SURGERY 
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Warrington PCNs 
 
 

PCN Practice 

Clinical Director 

Central and West Warrington Causeway Medical Centre Dr Laura Mount 

Central and West Warrington Dallam Lane Medical Centre 

Central and West Warrington Eric Moore Partnership Medical Practice 

Central and West Warrington Folly Lane Medical Centre 

Central and West Warrington Helsby Street 

Central and West Warrington Penketh Health Centre 

Warrington Central East Cockhedge Medical Centre Dr Mike Northey 

Warrington Central East Fairfield Surgery 

Warrington Central East Greenbank Surgery 

Warrington Central East Holes Lane Surgery 

Warrington Central East Manchester Road Surgery 

East Warrington Birchwood Medical Centre Dr Rakhi Raj 

East Warrington Fearnhead Cross Medical Centre 

East Warrington Padgate Medical Centre 

Warrington Innovation Network 4 Seasons Medical Centre Dr Dan Bunstone 

Warrington Innovation Network 
Chapelford Medical Centre 

Warrington Innovation Network Culcheth Medical Centre 

Warrington Innovation Network Guardian ST Medical Centre 

Warrington Innovation Network Parkview Medical Practice 

Warrington Innovation Network Springfields Medical Centre 

Warrington Innovation Network Westbrook Medical Centre 

South Warrington Network Brookfield Surgery Dr Ash Ahluwalia 

South Warrington Network Lakeside Surgery 

South Warrington Network Latchford Medical Centre 

South Warrington Network Stockton Heath Medical Centre 

South Warrington Network Stretton Medical Centre 
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Wirral PCNs 
 

 
 
 

PCN
Service Delivery 

Unit
Clinical Directors GP Practices

Blackheath MC

Egremont MC

Leasowe MP

Grove Road Surgery

St Hilary GP

Manor HC

Central Park MC

St George’s MC

Liscard GP

The Village MC

Somerville MC

Moreton Cross GP

Moreton HC

Moreton MC

Hoylake Road

Hoylake & Meols MC

Cavendish

Gladstone MC

Holmands MC

Prenton & Woodchurch MC

Miriam MC

Vittoria MC (G)

Vittoria MC (K)

Townfield HC

Heatherlands MC

Church Road MP

Kings Lane MP

Teehey Lane MC

Devaney MC

Hamilton MC

Whetstone MC

Riverside Surgery

St Catherine's Surgery

The Villa MC

Paxton Medical Group (Claughton & Fender Way Group Practice)

Allport Surgery

Eastham GP

Spital Surgery

The Orchard Surgery

Civic MC

Sunlight GP

Greasby GP

Commonfield

Marine Lake MP

West Wirral GP

Upton GP

Heswall & Pensby GP

H
e

al
th

ie
r 

So
u

th
 W

ir
ra

l 

P
C

N

H
e

al
th

ie
r 

W
e

st
 W

ir
ra

l 

P
C

N

Dr David Jones 

(Heswall and Pensby 

Group Practice)

Dr Michael Corrie 

(Commonfield Road 

Surgery)

Dr Jonathan Cockrell 

(The Villa Medical Centre)

 Dr Kinnari Kapoor 

(St Catherine's Surgery)

Wallasey 

Wellbeing 

Dr Thomas Wyatt 

(The Orchard Surgery)

Dr Nazia Mohammed 

(Eastham Group Practice)

B
ir

ke
n

h
e

ad

North Coast 

Alliance

Arno Primary Care 

Alliance

Dr Abhi Mantgani 

(Miriam Medical Centre)

Dr John Mottram 

(Blackheath Medical 

Centre)

W
al

la
se

y
M

o
re

to
n

 &
 

M
e

o
l P

C
N

Dr Jenny Harris 

(Moreton Cross Group 

Practice)

Brighter 

Birkenhead 

Dr Jamie Barfield

(The Village Medical 

Centre)

Dr Abhi Mantgani 

(Miriam Medical Centre)

Dr Mohammad Salahuddin 

(Gladstone Medical 

Centre)
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Warrington GP Clinical Systems 
 

Practice System 

Causeway Medical Centre TPP 

Dallam Lane Medical Centre Emis 

Eric Moore Partnership Medical Practice TPP 

Folly Lane Medical Centre TPP 

Helsby Street TPP 

Penketh Health Centre TPP 

Cockhedge Medical Centre Emis 

Fairfield Surgery TPP 

Greenbank Surgery TPP 

Holes Lane Surgery TPP 

Manchester Road Surgery Emis 

Birchwood Medical Centre TPP 

Fearnhead Cross Medical Centre Emis 

Padgate Medical Centre TPP 

4 Seasons Medical Centre TPP 

Chapelford Medical Centre TPP 

Culcheth Medical Centre TPP 

Guardian ST Medical Centre TPP 

Parkview Medical Practice TPP 

Springfields Medical Centre TPP 

Westbrook Medical Centre TPP 

Brookfield Surgery TPP 

Lakeside Surgery TPP 

Latchford Medical Centre TPP 

Stockton Heath Medical Centre Emis 

Stretton Medical Centre Emis 

 


